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Background and Purpose: ​In the light of the new global paradigm of universal             
health coverage (UHC), the issue around the financing of health care services is             
receiving new and strong recognition by international partners and national          
governments. The early development and adoption of integrated digital tools plays a            
crucial role in a successful implementation of UHC strategies. The openIMIS Initiative            
was set up as a joint initiative by the Swiss and the German Development              
Cooperations to establish a community of users and developers around an Open            
Source software for the management of health financing schemes (openIMIS) and to            
provide for a seamless integration into the activities of related communities from the             
global digital health ecosystem such as the Open Health Information Exchange           
(OpenHIE) community. Currently being used to manage a variety of health insurance            
schemes in Nepal, Tanzania, Cameroon, Chad, and DRC, openIMIS offers seamless           
connections between beneficiaries, health service providers, and payers.  
 
Methods: As part of the overall software development investments into the openIMIS            
technology stack, global good developers were invited to propose development          
projects that would introduce openIMIS interoperability with other global goods from           
the OpenHIE architecture. In a co-creation process that was managed by the Digital             
Square platform, three proposals were selected and funded to develop an integration            
of openIMIS with DHIS2, OpenMRS and BAHMNI on the basis of the HL7 FHIR              
interoperability standard. The three teams were integrated into the openIMIS          
developers committee to enable a seamless integration into the openIMIS roadmap           
and release cycle. In addition, the openIMIS community has been working with the             
OpenHIE community to ensure that data exchange processes and requirements          
meet the needs of healthcare financing communities, and to develop and adapt            
OpenHIE workflows to incorporate health finance data sharing use cases and country            
needs. Figure 1 illustrates the anticipated role of openIMIS as its integrated into the              
OpenHIE landscape, supporting ​health financing and insurance business domain         
services within a health information exchange (HIE). 



 
Figure 1 - Integration of openIMIS into the OpenHIE landscape 

 
Results: openIMIS now possesses a set of HL7 FHIR compatible APIs that allow the              
exchange of patient and claim data with other information systems in the health             
sector. Countries and organisations that have adopted an eHealth strategy based on            
HL7 FHIR are able to implement more efficient digital workflows to strengthen their             
road to UHC. The standards-based approach also opens up opportunities for           
supporting a range of HIE workflows and interacting with other HIE components and             
registries (e.g. Shared Health Record, Client Registry, Facility Registry), as well as a             
move towards openIMIS in the role of a ​health financing for UHC OpenHIE reference              
technology.  
 
Conclusions & Discussion​: The open ideation and development processes of          
Digital Square and the openIMIS Initiative enabled a very fruitful and harmonic            
development process run by a diverse group of developers from different           
organizations. The adherence to standards set by the HL7 FHIR and the Joint             
Learning Initiative provided a framework for a clear and efficient scoping of a scalable              
global good. The authors wish to trigger off a discussion in the audience to generate               
further ideas for distributed health financing processes and invite other global good            
developers to be part of the OpenHIE interoperability efforts. 


